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COUNCIL CHAIR SPEAKS: 

 

  Thoughts from the Council Chairperson        

Hello Lions and Leos of MD-1.  I am 

honored and humbled to have been 

selected as the Council Chairperson for 

the Lions year 2020-21 by the incoming 

council of governors.  I am excited to be 

able to serve the Lions of MD-1 and I am 

ready to get started. 

 

Firstly, I want to thank IPCC Jerome Perez 

for his steady leadership during this past 

Lions year.  Our organization is facing 

challenges we have not dealt with before 

and he did a great job of guiding us 

through everything.  I also want to thank 

the outgoing council of governors I had 

the pleasure of serving with last year.  I 

made friends I will have the rest of my life 

and I am proud of what the council was 

able to accomplish.   

 

Congratulations to our incoming council 

of governors for taking office in your 

respective districts!!  This year is going to 

pose some new challenges to our 

organization. There is no roadmap or 

template for how to best navigate thru 

and emerge out of a pandemic.  The 

council will work together and help each 

other figure out these things as we go. I 

know they will do a great job this year!! 

 

Thank you to the incoming state 

committee chairs for stepping forward to 

serve.  We are all grateful for the extra 

time and effort it takes to serve at the 

multiple district level.   

 

This year one of my goals as CC is to help 

foster more communication between the 

COG and the GAT team.  I have already 

discussed this with the stakeholders, and 

everyone seems ready to make that 

happen.  This will help us be more 

proactive as we try to address needs, 

issues, ideas, etc. 

 

You are going to be hearing a lot about 

NAMI this year.  It stands for the North 

American Membership Initiative.  This is a 

program LCI is launching to help grow 

our membership. It is critical to our 

future.  Keep an eye out for more 

information about this program.  

 

The dates and locations for this year’s 

council meetings are: 

• 2nd Council Meeting - September 

12, 2020, President Abraham Lincoln 

Hotel, Springfield 
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• 3rd Council Meeting - December 5, 

2020, President Abraham Lincoln Hotel, 

Springfield 

• 4th Council Meeting - February 27, 

2021, Holiday Inn, East Peoria 

• 5th Council Meeting - Lions of 

Illinois State Convention, May 14, 2021, 

President Abraham Lincoln Hotel, 

Springfield 

 

It is time to begin our journey into a new 

Lions year and it will be unlike any that 

have come before.  I know we will meet 

the challenges, overcome them, and 

emerge stronger.  

 

In closing I want to thank you for all you 

are doing to serve your communities. 

Thank you for reading. 

 

MD-1 Council Chairperson Joe Vinyard 

jvinyard1@comcast.net 

FROM GLOBAL LEADERSHIP CHAIR: 

 
With the Covid-19 situation, LCI has 

increased its virtual offerings.  On June 9, 

I participated in the NAMI webinar.  

NAMI stands for the North American 

Membership Initiative.  The initiative was 

piloted in several sights across the US 

and Canada.  It is now being rolled out to 

all districts in the US and Canada.  If you 

missed the webinar, it will be available 

soon on www.lionsclubs.org.  Go to the 

website and put virtual events center in 

the search box.  The upcoming events are 

listed for registration.  Those that have 

passed are available to view and utilize.  

Any Lion can participate. 

 

One of the pieces of the NAMI webinar 

was a listing of resources available to 

clubs, districts and multiple districts.  To 

get to these exceptional resources, go to 

www.lionsclubs.org and put NAMI in the 

search box.  There are resources to  

 

-Rejuvenate Districts with New Clubs 

-Revitalize Clubs with New Members 

-Re-motivate Members with New 

Fellowships and Exciting Service 

-Support District and Club Leaders 

-Market your Club or District 

 

Each community has different needs.  It is 

up to the local Lions Club to meet those 

needs through relevant activities that are 

meaningful to your members.  What does 

your club need?  What does your district 

need?  The tools are there and waiting to 

be used.  Check out the resources now! 

 

-Lion Jama Wahl 

State Global Leadership Chair 
jamawahl@yahoo.com 

mailto:jvinyard1@comcast.net
mailto:jamawahl@yahoo.com
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The story of LCIF is epic—filled with unlimited compassion and tireless support of 
Lions service. For more than 50 years, we’ve dedicated our energies to increasing 
the ability of Lions everywhere, helping them empower the communities they 
serve. With every grant we give, our history grows, along with the impact of 
Lions. Today, we couldn’t be more proud of where we stand, or more excited 
about the future of our work. 
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The Oak Lawn Lions Club served lunch 
today to the Oak Lawn Police Department 
and to the Fire Department which has 3 
stations. Governor Joni McMillan presented 
a check to the Pilgrim Faith Church Food 
Pantry from the Oak Lawn Lions Club for a  
$1000.00. We thank all of our first 
responders for the work they are doing for 
their community. 
----------------------------------------------------------

 
Genoa-Kingston Citizen/Student of the Year 
2020 
Presented by Genoa Lions 
 
 In the past years the Genoa Lions 
have invited the 12 recipients of the Citizen 
of the Year Award and their parents to a 
dinner and award ceremony mid April. 
Dinner was always served prior to the 
award ceremony with pork chops hot from 
the grill served along with a battery of 
salads and desserts prepared by the 
Masonic Lodge, great food for a good cause. 
Brent O’Daniell the current Superintendent 
of G-K School District, would give a brief 
greeting to those assembled in the 
Sanctuary. He would then introduce the 
Principal for the first and second graders. 
The Principal or an interested teacher 
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would introduce the student to the 
audience and sing their praises. This would 
continue from first grade all the way to the 
senior in High School. Unfortunately, this 
year, due to the Covid 19 pandemic, the 
Ceremony and Dinner have been cancelled. 
This cancellation was required by the 
guidelines of  the State of Illinois. 
 The Lions and the school district staff 
firmly believe that the 12 students should 
still be recognized for their achievements so 
this is how the Genoa Lions wish to 
proceed. An Award Letter from the Genoa 
Lions with an accompanying Citizen of the 
Year medal will be mailed to each of the 12 

recipients. Additionally, this press release 
and a photograph from a past year will be 
sent to the DeKalb Chronicle for 
publication. This press release will also be 
forwarded to the School District.  
 As much as this watered-down 
celebration of the 12 deserving students 
saddens the Genoa Lions, it is the best 
solution for all of us at this time. 
But most importantly, these deserving 
students should be recognized for being 
exemplary student citizens this year 
 
Rene’ A. VanDerHeyden 
Genoa Lions Secretary 

-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
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Disposable latex gloves are being packaged 
by Westmont Lion Sandy for Lion Jim 

 
Liceago’s display for the Westmont 
community.    
 
Westmont Lions Chris Svitek and Debbie 
Richey distributed face masks made by Lion 
Chris’ wife in front of the local Jewel-Osco. 
Lions’ candy was also available for a 
donation. A total of $118 was collected for 
the Lions’ efforts.    
----------------------------------------------------------  

 
Malta Lions participated in the DeKalb 
County Community Gardens Grow Mobile 
program. One of the participants said, “The 
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Lions Club delivered a box to me. Was like 
Christmas. Opening it and going through 
each item was fun. For a one-person home, 
I will have many meals and several snacks. 
Thank you everyone. Especially Tom and 
Brenda. Also Vicki and Denny, making sure I 
was on the delivery list. I appreciate all of 
you.”    

-------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

 
Cary Allen from Basics DeKalb County, 
which is housed in the Regional Office of 
Education, gave away diapers at the DeKalb 
Community Gardens pop-up event 
sponsored by Waterman Lions Club.    
---------------------------------------------------------- 

 
Elburn Lions Club created a chance to help 
support Pat Hill, a former Elburn Lion and a 
community resident battling cancer for six 

years, with its first-ever Virtual Fundraiser! 
Originally, a benefit was scheduled for April 
2020 but needed to be canceled due to the 
COVID-19 pandemic, so everything was 
switched to an online format. A total of 70 
raffle items had been collected and there 
was to be a 50/50 raffle. Tickets were sold 
through an online link until 12:00 Noon on 
June 3, 2020. The winners of the raffle 
items were drawn via Face Book Live on 
June 3, 2020 at 5:00 PM. All tickets were to 
be received at the clubhouse by 12:00 
Noon, June 3, 2020 with payment. Any 
tickets orders & payments that came after 
12:00 Noon deadline on June 3, 2020 were 
considered a donation to the Pat Hill 
Medical Fund. The virtual fundraiser 
consisted of items that were donated by 
local businesses and residents for the 
benefit. A total of $6,800 was earned for 
the Pat Hill Medical Fund and presented to 
Pat and her two children, Alexa and Tyler, 
by Elburn Lions Club President Lion Chet 
Cybulski.  Pat Hill, son Tyler, and daughter 
Alexa.   
-------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

Hinckley Lions Club members prepare pork 
chop dinners for a drive-through fundraiser 
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in May. More than one way to “skin a cat” 
when clubs can’t do it the traditional way!! 
Good thinking, Lions!    

-------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

 
DeKalb Community Gardens Director Dan 
Kinney, center, and two Waterman Lions 
put groceries in one of 87 cars that arrived 
at the pop-up food distribution event held 
in Waterman.    
-------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

 
It may be “just writing out checks,” but the 
McHenry Lions Club’s donations to two 
local food pantries ($1,000 each) does a lot 
of good for a lot of people during this time.    
---------------------------------------------------------- 

Aurora Noon Lions Club sponsored a 
"Moove the Milk" promotion to feed area 
residents. Sarah Dunnigan (l) of Oswego 
loads up a patron's car Sunday with milk 
and other dairy products from Aurora 

Interfaith Food Pantry during a free drive-
thru milk pantry at Jaycee Park in Oswego. 
Aurora Noon Lion Becky Dunnigan, (r) 
Interfaith Food Pantry outreach coordinator 
and Sarah's mom, handed out 130 gallons 
of milk plus yogurt, butter and cheddar-
cheese shreds.    
--------------------------------------------------------- 

 
Crystal Lake’s electronic sign, originally 
funded by Crystal Lake Lions Club, 
congratulates a local business in town for all 
to see.    
---------------------------------------------------------- 

Aurora Noon Lions Club member Bill Poss, 
owner of Luigi's Pizza in Aurora, serves 
dessert to fellow Lions Monday, June 15, 
when the club resumed in-person luncheon 
meetings at Luigi's. Due to COVID-19, 
meetings were held on the Zoom video 
conferencing platform since March.    
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----------------------------------------------------------  
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On June 13th, Channahan Lions Club 
members of our group donated $50.00 gift 
cards from Script to 20 members of our 
community and spent the afternoon passing 
out to Nurses in our community. 
------------------------------------------------------

 
Streator Hardscrabble From a safe 
social distance Treasurer Karyn Dzurison 
and incoming Club President Donna 
Mikolajczyk presented a $1500 check in 
support of Streator Unlimited, the local 
social service agency serving those with 
disabilities, to John Mallaney, Executive 
Administrator. 
------------------------------------------------------ 

Spring Valley Lions on June 23, DG Joe 
Vinyard installed new members into the 
club.  (L-R)  Mickey Ryman, District 
Governor Joe Vinyard, Melody Burgess, 
Linda Strahorn.  He also inducted the 

 

 
 

officers for the upcoming Lions year.   
(front row) Melody Burgess, treasurer 
Linda Strahorn; (back row)  Mickey 
Ryman, District Governor Joe Vinyard, 
president Richard Hafley. 
------------------------------------------------------ 
CONGRATULATIONS TO DISTRICT 1BK’S  
NEWEST MELVIN JONES FELLOWS 
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District Governor Joe presents Lion Melissa 
‘Missy’ Honiotes with the District’s 2020 
Melvin Jones Fellow honor. DG Joe wanted 
to present the MJF to Lion Missy before she 

made the move to Florida. Cabinet 
Secretary PDG Charlie Siefert and DG Joe 
arranged a surprise ‘send off’ party to make 
that happen. Lion Missy has been the 
District’s Newsletter Editor, Leo Advisor, & 
Scholarship Chair for the past three years. 
She is a 16 year member of the Joliet Noon 
Lions where she has been the Leo Advisor 
for the last 7 years. Lion Missy is the 
daughter of Bobbi and PDG John Joseph 
Honiotes, and the granddaughter of Ann 
and PDG Andy Honiotes. Not only is she a 
third generation Lion, she also becomes a 
third generation Melvin Jones Fellow 
honoree. 

---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

 


